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Books from the library of the late 
Geoff Allen are on offer by his 
widow Jean to help fund her long 
term care. Geoff was a founder 
member of the V8 Register of the 
MG Car Club and formerly 
foreman of the Rectifications 
Department at the MG Plant 
where he worked for 27 years. 
 

 
The Last Open Road by BS Levy 

is a novel written by B.S. Levy, a 
long time amateur racer. It tells 
the story of a young mechanic 
from Passaic, New Jersey who 
becomes involved in automobile 
road racing during its peak in the 
1950s. The book follows Buddy 
Palumbo, the main character, as 
he has to balance family life with 
working on cars. 
Edition: pub 1993, edition 1993. 
Condition: 2 signed by the author. 
Offers over £40 

 

 
The Chequered Flag – 100 
Years of Motor Racing by Ivan 

Rendall  

Edition: pub 1993, edition 1993. 
Condition: 1. 
Offers over £5 

 

 
Lagonda - an illustrated History 
1900–1950 by Geff Seaton. 

Edition: pub 1998, edition 1998. 
Condition: 2 signed by the author 
plus correspondence with the 
author. 
Offers over £35 

 

 
The Rolls Royce Wraith by Tom 

C Clarke. 
Edition: pub 1986, edition 1986. 
Condition: 1. 
Offers over £50 

 

 
Motor Repair and Overhauling. 

Morris Eight and Ten. 
Edition: not known. 
Condition: 2 original. 
Offers over £10 

 
 
 

 
As Old as the Industry Riley 
1898-1969 by David G Styles. 

Edition: pub 1982, edition 1982. 
Condition: 1. 
Offers over £20 

 

 
The British Motor Bus by Gavin 

Booth. 
Edition: pub 1986, edition 1995. 
Condition: 3 loose pages. 
Offers over £10 

 

 
1939-1945  City Motors During 
the War Years by City Motors. 

Edition: pub 1946, edition 1946. 
Condition: 1 complete with thank 
you message signed by Geoff 
Allen. 
Offers over £10 
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Buses Annual 1980 edited by 

Gavin Booth. 
Edition: pub 1979, edition 1979. 
Condition: 2 dedication to Geoff 
Allen 1986. 
Offers over £5 

 

 
1919-1949 thirty years service 
on wheels by City Motors.. 

Edition: pub 1949, edition 1949. 
Condition: 2 worn 
Offers over £5 

 

 
Motor Show Oct 19-29 1960 
Earls Court Official Catalogue. 

Edition: pub 1960, edition 1960. 
Condition: 2 
Offers over £15 

 

 
International Motor Racing 
1978 edited by Barrie Gill. 

Edition: pub 1978, edition 1978. 
Condition: 3 ex library 
Offers over £5 

 

 
Morgan Cars 1969-1979 by RM 

Clarke, pub by Brooklands Books. 
Edition: pub 1979, edition 1979. 
Condition: 1 
Offers over £20 

 

 
Raymond Mays of Bourne – the 
driving force behind ERA & 
BRM racing cars by Michael 

McGregor. 
Edition: pub 1995, edition 1995. 
Condition: 1 from Jeff Ward to 
Geoff Allen on his retirement. 
Offers over £40 

 
The St Michael History of Cars 

by Peter Roberts. 
Edition: pub 1977, edition 1979. 
Condition: 2 cover slightly 
creased. 
Offers over £5 
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Vauxhall cars since 1903  

Pub: 1973 by Vauxhall GM 
Condition 2 – note to Geoff Allen 
from Don Bishop 
Offers over £10 

 

 
10HP 4 Seated Humber Cars 
and how to manage them. 

Condition 4 pages missing 
Offers over £15 

 
 
Note 

 
Information on the sale of 
Geoff Allen’s books 

Please visit the information 
webpage for full details of the 
sale and terms and conditions. 
www.v8register.net/GA-
books.htm  
 
Details of any signing of the 
book or related 
correspondence and 
documentation 

Where a note is highlighted in 
yellow in the description of a book 
above, Stuart Danton will be able 
to provide bidders with further 
information. 
 
Bidding 

Please send your bid for any 
book you would like to buy to 
Stuart Danton who is managing 
the sale of these books. He will 
provide updates on the bidding 

for each book until the close of 
bidding.  
Tel: 01260 290027 

Email:  studanton@gmail.com  
 
Post & packaging costs 

Postage & packaging will be 
extra. Details of those costs will 
be available from Stuart Danton 
or alternatively you can collect 
any book you purchase from 
Stuart Danton in Congleton in 
Cheshire, UK. 
 
Payment 

Payments for any book or books 
will be made by cheque or cash. 
Stuart Danton will notify 
successful bidders of the payee 
for their cheque in settlement of 
the sum payable, being the total 
of the final bid price for the book 
and the P&P cost for sending the 
book to you. 
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